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Twenty-six year old Serenity Walker is the beautiful single mom to a precocious five-year old son. Forced to
deal with a deceitful boyfriend who wants nothing to do with the child they created together, she decides to
raise her son alone...it's just her and God. In her attempts to carve a life for herself as a professional chef, she
has no real desire for a man in her world. That all changes when she meets ex-football player Jason Bullock.
Burned by a past relationship, Jason is not really looking to give his heart away again. As God would have it,
that all changes when he meets Serenity. It's practically love at first sight for Jason and all out resistance for
her. Jason knows their love is special. So he's willing to fight for Serenity. Even if it means putting up a
chase.
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From reader reviews:

Jon McKibben:

Chasing Serenity: A Christian Romance Novel can be one of your basic books that are good idea. Many of
us recommend that straight away because this book has good vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in
vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but still delivering the information. The article writer giving
his/her effort to put every word into joy arrangement in writing Chasing Serenity: A Christian Romance
Novel yet doesn't forget the main point, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource
information that maybe you can be among it. This great information can drawn you into brand new stage of
crucial thinking.

Daniel Butler:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when compared with can
satisfy your short space of time to read it because this time you only find publication that need more time to
be study. Chasing Serenity: A Christian Romance Novel can be your answer given it can be read by you
actually who have those short free time problems.

Jack Nguyen:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make
professionals understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon.
You will see that now, a lot of publisher that will print many kinds of book. Often the book that
recommended to you is Chasing Serenity: A Christian Romance Novel this book consist a lot of the
information in the condition of this world now. This book was represented how do the world has grown up.
The language styles that writer use for explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. That is why this book suitable all of you.

Joshua Stickley:

Is it a person who having spare time and then spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or
just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Chasing Serenity: A Christian
Romance Novel can be the respond to, oh how comes? A book you know. You are so out of date, spending
your extra time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these textbooks
have than the others?
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