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All theology is contextual; but not all contextual theology is good theology. Truly great theology must be
rooted in a double context: it must be obedient to the living Jesus, and it must work out that obedience in the
time and place in which it is set. Chris toh)gy at the Crossroads is an example of truly great contextual
theology. The context in which Fr Sobrino writes is South America and the dominating presence of the
oppressed. The situation demands an "operational" theology, a theology which will make a real difference to
the way people live and die and suffer. In a real sense it would be true to say that the liberation theologians
are concerned about theology not at all as a cognitive discipline but only as a way of following Jesus. In this
book Fr Sobrino applies the method and the passion of liberation theology to Christology, and the result is
fascinating: it excited me, and it filled me with guilt and dread. Fr Sobrino describes his approach as
"historical Christology", and by that he means that we must return to the Jesus of history if we are to avoid
treason to the Christ of faith. A theology which cuts itself free of the passion and defeat of the human Jesus
in the name of a theology of the Risen Christ ends by losing both. Jesus can only be Christ for us if we
follow his way. It is impossible in the compass of a short review to do justice to such a compelling and
comprehensive book. It is radical without being reductionist. It is relentless in its refusal to let us avoid the
challenge of Jesus by sliding into theological or cultic abstractions. It will stimulate, illuminate and infuriate
those whose minds are jaded by the current state of British theology. And, like all great theology, it will
bring you uncomfortably close to the living Jesus' (Richard Holloway in Church Times).
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From reader reviews:

Roy Brown:

The book Christology at the Crossroads: A Latin American Approach gives you the sense of being enjoy for
your spare time. You can use to make your capable more increase. Book can to become your best friend
when you getting stress or having big problem using your subject. If you can make looking at a book
Christology at the Crossroads: A Latin American Approach being your habit, you can get more advantages,
like add your own capable, increase your knowledge about a few or all subjects. You could know everything
if you like open up and read a reserve Christology at the Crossroads: A Latin American Approach. Kinds of
book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or others. So , how do you think about this
publication?

Elaine Harvey:

Hey guys, do you wishes to finds a new book you just read? May be the book with the concept Christology
at the Crossroads: A Latin American Approach suitable to you? The actual book was written by well known
writer in this era. The actual book untitled Christology at the Crossroads: A Latin American Approachis a
single of several books in which everyone read now. This specific book was inspired a lot of people in the
world. When you read this guide you will enter the new way of measuring that you ever know ahead of. The
author explained their strategy in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to know the core of this
e-book. This book will give you a large amount of information about this world now. So that you can see the
represented of the world in this book.

Sheila Whitley:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them loved
ones or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you read you can spent 24 hours a day to
reading a guide. The book Christology at the Crossroads: A Latin American Approach it is quite good to
read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. When
you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore easily to
read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book provides high quality.

Jose Johnson:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt this when they get a
half regions of the book. You can choose the actual book Christology at the Crossroads: A Latin American
Approach to make your current reading is interesting. Your skill of reading talent is developing when you
including reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the opinion about book
and reading through especially. It is to be first opinion for you to like to available a book and go through it.



Beside that the e-book Christology at the Crossroads: A Latin American Approach can to be your brand-new
friend when you're really feel alone and confuse using what must you're doing of that time.
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